
                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/01/12 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2012 
 
CONTRACT IR-33291-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902222                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW INTERCHANGE, SIGNS, LIGHTS, SIGNALS, AND MARKIN ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  17,469,400.00 
CALL: 156                 ROUTE: 69                                                  FT. WAYNE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON I-69, NORTH OF SR 1 AT UNION CHAPEL ROAD 
 
                         COUNTY: ALLEN 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID   TYPE LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             | $    477,617.88 |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 & 0002 HMA                 |                             |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PRESENT VALUE OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE     |                             | $    319,086.79 |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 & 0004 PCCP                |                             |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA CROSSOVER OPTION       | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  | $  3,606,006.30 |  R | X |    AWARD  
            | SECTION 0002 HMA NIGHTTIME CLOSURE OPT  | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  |          NO BID |    |   |     
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP CROSSOVER OPTION      | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  | $  4,429,690.56 |  R | X |     
            | SECTION 0004 PCCP NIGHTTIME CLOSURE OPT | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1065659  | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC         | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1990  | $ 10,364,416.08 |  R | X |    AWARD  
            | SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |   |    DBE  6.00%    
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC                        | ANDERSON      765-643-5358  | $  4,791,228.26 |  R |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA CROSSOVER OPTION       | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC                        | ANDERSON      765-643-5358  | $  4,209,288.15 |  R |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA NIGHTTIME CLOSURE OPT  | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC                        | ANDERSON      765-643-5358  | $  5,186,446.34 |  R |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP CROSSOVER OPTION      | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC                        | ANDERSON      765-643-5358  | $  4,597,819.23 |  R |   | 
            | SECTION 0004 PCCP NIGHTTIME CLOSURE OPT | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC                        | ANDERSON      765-643-5358  | $ 10,637,901.37 |  R |   | 
            | SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/01/12 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 13, 2012 
 
CONTRACT IR-33291-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902222                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW INTERCHANGE, SIGNS, LIGHTS, SIGNALS, AND MARKIN ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  17,469,400.00 
CALL: 156                 ROUTE: 69                                                  FT. WAYNE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON I-69, NORTH OF SR 1 AT UNION CHAPEL ROAD 
 
                         COUNTY: ALLEN 
    CODE                  BIDDER                          ADDRESS        PHONE/FAX     AMOUNT OF BID   TYPE LOW     REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0001 HMA CROSSOVER OPTION       | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0002 HMA NIGHTTIME CLOSURE OPT  | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  |          NO BID |    |   | 
            | SECTION 0003 PCCP CROSSOVER OPTION      | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  |  $ 4,282,249.51 |  R |   | 
            | SECTION 0004 PCCP NIGHTTIME CLOSURE OPT | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1374866  | PRIMCO INC                              | FORT WAYNE    260-478-1548  |  $10,782,857.18 |  R |   | 
            | SECTION 0005 COMMON ITEMS               | IN                          |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
NOTE: THE LOW BID RANKING OF THE BIDS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF FOLLOWING COMBINATIONS OF SECTION BIDS, AND CORRESPONDING PRESENT VALUES 
OF FUTURE MAINTENANCE: 
SECTION 0001, AND SECTION 0005; OR 
SECTION 0002, AND SECTION 0005; OR 
SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0005; OR 
SECTION 0004, AND SECTION 0005. 
THE LOWEST RANKING AMOUNT CALCULATED = SECTION 0002  + PVFM 0002   + SECTION 0005  
                                     = $3,606,006.30 + $477,617.88 + $10,364,416.08 = $14,448,040.26 
LOW BIDDER CONTRACT AMOUNT = $13,970,422.38 
 


